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2 Minutes from March 6, 2007 Conference Call

2.1 Agenda

· Attendance 

· Discuss and approve agenda.
· Report on classification of MAC Comments.
· Planning of Comment Resolution time in Orlando.
· Discussion on the assignment of deferred comments that have no submission associated with them and that were either unassigned in London or not actionable. 
2.2 Notes

· Reports on classification of MAC comments.
· Brief discussion on planning of comment resolution in Orlando.

· Discussion on the assignment and material submission of the MAC comments that are in the categories of “accepted”, “accepted in principle”, “defer until clarification”.

· Comment assignees are encouraged to submit resolution documents to the Orlando meeting. 

· The announced call in March 8, 2007 will be cancelled. 

3 Minutes from March 29, 2007 Conference Call
3.1 Agenda

· Plan for joint MAC-sensing call for harmonizing the sensing and MAC text.

· Discussion on Comment #30 and #509, refer to 22-06-0219-01-0000, Individual CPE Maximum TPC, for section 6.13.5.

· Discussion on Comment #242, #136 (solution to resolved comment #244 for GPS synchronization acceptable to resolve these comments?)

· Discussion on Comment #532 (support of AMC);

· Discussion on Comment #111, #512, 224, #93, #95 (if the proposed changes acceptable?).
3.2 Notes

· The ad hoc group decided to review and discuss the 22-07-xxxx-00-0000-MAC-Text-on-Sensing.doc (provided by Steve Shellhammer) in the next call before joining sensing call for harmonizing the sensing and MAC text. Review of the sensing text would be needed as well.
· David Mazzarese and Gerald Chouinard summarized the 22-06-0219-01-0000. The group agreed to accept in principle the suggested text change in the document, which is subject to further review in the next call on its new editorial revision to be provided by David and Gerald. 
· David suggested discussing 22-07-016-00-0000_Proposed_text_changes_to_22-06-0259-00-0000_v0.2_AnnexB2 for comment #138 in the next call.
· Doc: 22-07-0120-01-0000, which resolved comment #244, is to be posted for facilitating discussion on Comment #242, #136 in the next call.
· AMC is supported.

· New suggested remedy for comment #111 (accepted in principle by the MAC group in Orlando) is requested by Gerald Chouinard to be further reviewed in the next call. 

4 Minutes from April 05, 2007 Conference Call

4.1 Agenda

· Discussion on Comment #30, #137 and #509, referring to 22-06-0219-03-0000, Individual CPE Maximum TPC, for section 6.13.5.
· Review and discuss 22-07-0162-01-0000-MAC-Text-on-Sensing.doc
· Discussion on other comments if time permits.

4.2 Notes

· Agreed unanimously by the group, comments CID #30, #137, and #509 are resolved by including 22-06-0219-03-0000 to the v0.3 of the standard draft. Some technical issues marked in square brackets are still open for further discussion in the Montreal face-to-face by the WG. David Mazzarese is to provide a new revision of the document that will fix editorial issues (such as the ones in the flow chart) to the reflector for the group’s further review before being included in the v0.3 standard draft.
·  Document 22-07-0162-01-0000-MAC-Text-on-Sensing.doc is reviewed and discussed. The group unanimously agreed to define in section 6.7 Common IEs for TV signals acknowledgment that are similar to the Part 74 Acknowledgement IE. The group was not able to complete reviewing the document due to the time limit and will resume the discussion in the next call.
5 Minutes from April 12, 2007 Conference Call
5.1 Agenda
· Discuss MAC-sensing harmonization.

· Discuss Comments #242, #136, refer to 22-07-0120-01-Network-Synchronization-Proposed-Text-Change.doc.
· Discuss Comments #111, #512, 224, #93, #95.
· Discuss comments #115, #176, #179, #331.

5.2 Notes

· A joint MAC-sensing meeting will be initiated.

· Modification on 22-07-0120-01 is suggested and will be posted on the reflector by Gerald.

· Will confirm with Steve Kuffner on comment 512 with the remedy for comment 111 that is acceptable to the group.

· Baowei suggests considering the case of scheduling a long quiet period within a superframe for resolving comment 224.
6 Minutes from April 19, 2007 Conference Call
6.1 Agenda
· Network-synchronization related comments based on  22-07-0120-02-Network-Synchronization-Proposed-Text-Change.doc

· Comments 224, 93 (resync after QP), 513 (PHY), 27(PHY), 159 (Sensing)

· Comments 16, 17, 115, 117, 118, 176, 179, 331 regarding superframe
· Comment 13, 523 (frame structure)

· Comment 24, 25, 27, 480, 513 (PHY related)
6.2 Notes

· Discuss 22-07-0120-02-Network-Synchronization-Proposed-Text-Change.doc. An new revision of the document will be provided.

· Discuss comment 224 and 93 on resynchronization after quiet period (related to quiet period scheduling). Baowei is to provide a submission on this.

7 Minutes from April 26, 2007 Conference Call
7.1 Agenda

· Comments 224, 93, 522 (resync after QP) - Baowei Ji's presentation.

· 513 (PHY), 27(PHY),

· Comments 16, 17, 115, 117, 118, 176, 179, 331 regarding superframe. 
· Other comments on quiet Period Scheduling and resync: 43, 521, 70, 125

7.2 Notes

· Defer decision on comment 224, 93, 522. Refer to the PHY team to consider a different PN sequences for the additional superframe preamble. MAC measures to differentiate a superframe or a regular frame when a superframe preamble is received should be considered as well.
· Factor linking EIRP to Maximum Transmit Power are known by the MAC (see additional text provided by Gerald). Hence the original text is fine. Comment 513 is resolved.

· Comment 27 is resolved by deleting section 6.8.15.3.3.4.1.

· 22-07-0170-00-0000_resolutions-superframe.doc is accepted by the group to resolve the related superframe comments.

· For comment 43 and 521, the statement: “For out-of-band measurements, quiet periods are not necessary” needs to be qualified. Special measures may be needed for ensuring out-of-band sensing performance. Need to be discussed in the WG/Sensing team.
8 Minutes from May 3, 2007 Conference
8.1 Agenda

· Sensing: 70, 125.
· Superframe: 17, 176, 179;

· SCH detection: 45;

· Frame Structure: 13, 523;

· PHY parameters: 24, 25, 27, 480;

· BS initialization: 510.
· BS sync: 183.
· Editorial-like: 95
8.2 Notes

· CID 70: Pending for Huawei’s submission for covering the case of MAC support for sensing without quiet period, if it’s not covered by the current draft.

· CID 125: Resolved by the new draft (v0.3).

· CID 17, 176, 179: Resolved by the new draft (v0.3).

· CID 45: Resolved by the new draft (v0.3).

· CID 13, 523: Resolved by the new draft (v0.3).

· CID 24: deferred for further discussion in Monteal.

· CID 25, 27, 480: Resolved by the new draft (v0.3).

· CID 510: need to confirm with Steve Kuffner if the new draft (with remedy for CID 190) is acceptable to resolve this comment.

· CID 183: Resolved by the new draft (v0.3).

· CID 95: Resolved by the new draft (v0.3) with remedy for CID 48.
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