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1.0 TGn Called to order at 8:01am
1.1 Review Document 09-0659r1 for Agenda /meeting slides

1.2 Review the Patent Policy

1.2.1 No reports were made in regards to potential Essential Patents.
1.3 Review of Previous Minutes:

1.3.1 See 11-09-0565r0 for minutes.

1.3.2 Read out the Executive Summary

1.3.3 No issues or matters arrising from the minutes

1.3.4 Move to approve May 09 Montreal TGn minutes as contained in 11-09-0565r0

1.3.4.1 Moved Jon Rosdahl 2nd Sheung Li

1.3.4.2 Unanimous Without objection

1.3.5 TGn CRC Teleconference Minutes

1.3.5.1 681, 693, 738

1.3.5.1.1 Each document covers the telecons for the respective Sponsor Letter Ballots

1.3.5.1.2 Move to approve the TGn Telecon Mintues as listed (09-681, 09-693, 09-738.
1.3.5.1.3 Moved: Jon Rosdahl 2nd John Barr

1.3.5.1.4 Passed unanimous without objection

1.4 TGn Ad Hoc Leadership Oranization recognized.

1.5 Review the “One Page History” (seeslide 17 – 09/0659r1)

1.6 Review of the Sponsor Ballots

1.6.1 Recirc #1 – 80%

1.6.2 Recirc #2 – 88%

1.6.3 Recirc #3 – 89.9%

1.6.4 Recird #4 – 90.8% but with the email vote change, we are over 91%.

1.6.5 Once we hit 75%, the IEEE-SA rules say that we can say we are complete, but traditionally we have worked to achieve at least 90%.

1.7 Review of the Master Schedule Plan (slide 25)

1.8 Review the time slot schedule for this week (slide 26-28)
1.9 Request to approve July ’09 TGn agenda as contained on slide 26 - 28 (with any minuted amendments) as contained in 0659 r1.

1.9.1 No objection, the chair set the Agenda. 
1.10 Review slide 29 on Actual Events
1.10.1 Note the block for TGw was a gating item.  

1.10.2 There was a typo in that the first set of “July” are really “May”

1.11 Review of slides 30-32 reporting on the events and plans/steps to get TGn draft to Revcom.  Deadline for being on the Agenda is July 31.

1.11.1 Still plan of record

1.12 Timeline was adjusted in May and had a publication date of Jan 2010.
1.12.1 RevCom approval currently published as Nov -09, but we are slightly ahead at this time.  Due to our preparations for preparing for the EC and RevCom,  We have had the Mandatory Editorial Coordination (MEC) has been done repeatedly, and we have provided the IEEE Editor a preview of the document ahead of the final approval for them to start reviewing the document in preparation for publication shortly after the IEEE-SA Board approval in Sept, and the Publication may occur during the month of Sept.  which will pull the schedule back quite a bit.

1.12.2 Note that TGw is required to be published just ahead of TGn.  However the message is that the post approval time until Publication will occur much quicker than expected.

1.13 Review the 802 OM Clause 13 Conditional Approval rule. (slide 34)

1.14 TGn EC RevCom report – 09-0674r1 has been prepared for presenting to the EC and RevCom.
1.14.1 This document is being reviewed this morning in preparation for formal approval by the TG.

1.14.2 Note on slide 3, the final results reflect a post vote change received by e-mail.

1.14.2.1 We have seen lots of ways to vote, and/or comment.

1.14.3 Review of Ballot Results by Ballot.
1.14.3.1  Total Comments received: 382 comments were received.

1.14.3.2 There were 51 assumed Unsatisfied received by voters that have not responded to queries as to if they were satisfied with the response.

1.14.4 Madatory Coordination from all entities are completed.

1.14.5 Review of “Updated Resolution”

1.14.5.1 Resolutions to comments once made are considered by MyBallot tool to never change.  However, we had the need to update a previous posted Resolution as the resolution to the pending accepted comment resolutions needed to be changed in order to gain approval from the “disapprove” voters.  The RevCom package will get both the MyBallot and our updated summary to explain the final disposition of comments.
1.14.6 Review of the final 80 unsatisfied Comments by ballot (Slide 8)

1.14.7 Review of the final 80 unsatisfied comments by commenter (slide 9)

1.14.8 Review of the final 80 Unsatisfied comments by Topic (slide 10)

1.14.9 Unsatisfied comments are embedded on slide 11.

1.14.9.1 They are in both formats – the xls file and in the myballot report format.

1.14.9.2 Both files have the updated resolutions for presentation and review.
1.14.10 During the review of the EC Motion, James Gilb an EC member asked to be the official 2nd for the EC Motion. (slide 13)

1.14.11 Discussion on how the data is to be presented to the EC.
1.14.11.1 Note that we have only 10 minutes

1.14.11.2 The slide set is carefully chosen to show the material in compressed time with the detail that is expected to be required.

1.14.11.3 It was pointed out that there is other interesting info that could be presented, and we may want to have the backup info in pocket if asked or to make a point.

1.14.11.4 Feedback on improvements to the slide deck are welcome.

1.14.12 Request to see if more time was needed to review this document.

1.14.13 Stand at ease while the motion is retrieved for presentation.

1.14.14 Of those in the room about 2/3 were expecting to be in attendance at Sept. Interim Meeting.
1.14.15 Motion #444: Approve Document 11-09-674r2 as the report to the 802 Executive Committee (EC) on the requirements for approval to forward P802.11n to RevCom and Request the IEEE 802 Executive Committee to forward P802.11n to RevCom.

1.14.15.1 Moved: Adrian Stephens, 2nd John Barr
1.14.15.2 The motion was edited to make it correct.  There is implicit WG request but the wording of the motion remains the same.

1.14.15.3 Count:  26-0-0 – motion passes.With applause
1.15 Review of Teleconference plan
1.15.1 Target  topics

1.15.1.1 July 22 – review results of the EC meeting

1.15.1.2  July 29 review the RevCom pack that has to be posted on July 31

1.15.2 RevCom and IEEE-SA SASB meeting is the week of Sept 9th
1.15.3 Discussion for the possible telecons for contingency plans.
1.15.4 Note the notice given to provide as much notice and rationale to why.
1.16 Timeline discussion:
1.16.1 Discussion on what the published dates should be.

1.16.1.1 Propose to change the RevCom date to Sept 2009 and the Publication date 60 days after (Nov 2009).

1.16.2 No objection to the proposed dates.

1.17 Review of the work items shows that we have concluded all the work items on the agenda.  So the question was asked if there was objection to release Thurs Timeslot?
1.17.1 No objection

1.18 No other business

1.19 History

1.19.1 Note that Sept 11th,, 2002 HTSG was formed and when RevCom considers it it will be on Sept 11th 2009…so an interesting coincidence.

1.20 Offically the Chair offers his personal thanks and appreciation for the work over the last 7 years.

1.21 TGn Final adjournment at 9:30am, Wednessday, July 15, 2009.
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Abstract


Minutes for TGn July Plenary 2009.





Executive Summary:  Having completed 5 Sponsor ballots, the TGn CRC meet for 1.5 hours to review the report for submitting the Draft to the EC and RevCom for approval. The Report was accepted and will be forwarded to the WG/EC/RevCom/SASB and it is expected that the TGn Amendment will be approved in Sept. 2009 with publication shortly thereafter.





An interesting coincidence was pointed out that the first meeting of HTSG was on Sept. 11, 2002, and the final approval by the Standards Board is scheduled for Sept. 11, 2009.
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